Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No. 2266

The Vehicle Excise Duty (Immobilisation, Removal and
Disposal of Vehicles) (Amendment) Regulations 2008

Amendment of Regulations
11. In Schedule 1 (the prescribed charges)—
(a) in Table I—
(i) in relation to item 1 in column (3) for “£80” there shall be substituted “£100”;
(i1) in relation to item 2—
(aa) in column (2) for “motorcycle” there shall be substituted “vehicle”; and
(bb) in column (3) for “£80” there shall be substituted “£100”;
(ii1) in relation to item 3—
(aa) in column (2) “, including a motorcycle” shall be omitted; and
(bb) in column (3) for “£160” there shall be substituted “£200’; and
(iv) in relation to item (4) for “£15” there shall be substituted “£21; and
(b) in Table II in column (3)—
(i) in relation to item 1 for “£120” there shall be substituted “£160”;
(i1) in relation to item 2 for “£300” there shall be substituted “£330”’; and
(iii) in relation to item 3 for “£600” there shall be substituted “£700”.

[DET 00085]



