
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No. 2847

The Statistics of Trade (Customs and Excise)
(Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations 2008

Amendment of the Statistics of Trade (Customs and Excise) Regulations 1992

2.—(1)  The Statistics of Trade (Customs and Excise) Regulations 1992(1) are amended as
follows:

(2)  In regulation 3(2), for “£260,000” substitute “£270,000”.
(3)  In regulation 4(2), for “£14,500,000” substitute “£16,000,000”.

(1) S.I. 1992/2790; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2004/3284 and S.I. 2006/3216.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/2790
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/3284
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/3216

