
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 1545

The Childcare (General Childcare
Register) (Amendment) Regulations 2009

Amendments to Schedule 3 to the Childcare (General Childcare Register) Regulations 2008

4. In paragraph 18(1)—
(1)  in sub-paragraph (d), for “20 days” substitute “28 days”;
(2)  in sub-paragraph (e)(ii), for “two years” substitute “three years”;
(3)  in sub-paragraph (f), for “two years” substitute “three years”.


