
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 1550

The Individual Savings Account
(Amendment) Regulations 2009

Amendments having effect for the tax year 2010-11 and succeeding tax years

7. In regulation 4(2)—
(a) for “£7,200” (as inserted by regulation 3(a)) substitute “£10,200”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,600” substitute “£5,100”.


