
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No. 1723

The Armed Forces and Reserve Forces
(Compensation Scheme) (Amendment) Order 2010

Amendment of articles 3, 9, 39, 40 and 41 of the principal Order

3.—(1)  In articles 3, 9 and 39 for “5 years” wherever it appears substitute “7 years”.
(2)  In article 3(c) for “five” substitute “7”.
(3)  In article 39(2) for the words “one year”, where they last appear, substitute “3 years”.
(4)  In article 39(3) for “one year from the date of death.” substitute “3 years beginning with the

day on which death occurred.”.
(5)  In articles 40 and 41 for the words “one year” on both occasions they appear substitute “3

years”.


