
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No. 2126

The Social Security (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (No. 4) Regulations 2010

Amendment of the Employment and Support Allowance Regulations 2008

5.—(1)  The Employment and Support Allowance Regulations 2008(1) are amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraphs (3) and (4) of regulation 45 (exempt work) for “£93.00” substitute “£95.00”.
(3)  In regulation 76(1) (deductions for councillor’s allowance) for “£93.00” substitute “£95.00”.
(4)  In paragraphs 5, 6 and 7 of schedule 7 (sums to be disregarded in the calculation of earnings)

for “£93.00” substitute “£95.00” each time it appears.

(1) S.I. 2008/794. The amounts specified in regulation 45 and 76 and paragraphs 5, 6 and 7 of schedule 7 were most recently
amended by S.I. 2009/2343.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/794
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/2343

