
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No. 554

The Blood Safety and Quality (Fees
Amendment) Regulations 2010

Amendment of regulation 22 of the principal Regulations

2.—(1)  Regulation 22 of the principal Regulations (fees) is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph (2)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,044” substitute “£3,074”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£513” substitute “£518”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£458” substitute “£463”.

(3)  In paragraph (2A)(b), for “£487” substitute “£492”.
(4)  In paragraph (3)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,557” substitute “£2,583”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,279” substitute “£1,292”.

(5)  In paragraph (3A), for “£676” substitute “£683”.
(6)  In paragraph (3C)(c), for “£487” substitute “£492”.
(7)  In paragraph (5)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,557” substitute “£2,583”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,279” substitute “£1,292”.

(8)  In paragraph (5B)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,557” substitute “£2,583”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,279” substitute “£1,292”.

(9)  In paragraph (5C)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,557” substitute “£2,583”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,279” substitute “£1,292”.

(10)  Before paragraph (6) insert—
“(5E)  The fee payable by a blood establishment or a person who is responsible for the

management of a hospital blood bank who gives a notification under regulation 12(1) of
its desire to make written representations to, or appear before and be heard by, a person
appointed by the Secretary of State, is £10,000.

(5F)  The Secretary of State will refund to that person—
(a) 60% of that fee if the person withdraws the notification two weeks before the

commencement of the hearing before the person appointed;
(b) 100% of that fee if, in respect of the hearing before a person appointed, the

decision notified by the Secretary of State is—
(i) not to suspend or revoke, as the case may be, the authorisation pursuant to

regulation 5;



Document Generated: 2024-06-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(ii) to withdraw any notice served pursuant to regulation 4(8), 5 or 11; or
(iii) to overturn the refusal of authorisation or the imposition of any condition

pursuant to regulation 4(5).”.
(11)  After paragraph (7)(iib) insert—
“(iic) the fee payable pursuant to paragraph (5E) shall be payable at the time the notification is

given;”.
(12)  In paragraph (9), for “The Secretary of State” substitute “Save in respect of the fee payable

under paragraph (5E), the Secretary of State”.

2


