
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 1506

The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger
and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2012

Increase of amounts

2.—(1)  In sections 3(1)(c) and 5(1)(c) of the Act (automatic enrolment), for “£7,475” substitute
“£8,105”.

(2)  In section 13(1) of the Act (qualifying earnings and earnings trigger)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£5,035” substitute “£5,564”; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£33,540” substitute “£42,475”.


