
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2013 No. 267

The Individual Savings Account
(Amendment) Regulations 2013

Amendment of the Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998

2.—(1)  The Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998(1) are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 4ZA of those Regulations (subscriptions to an account other than a junior ISA

account)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£5,640” substitute “£5,760”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£11,280” substitute “£11,520”.

(3)  In regulation 4ZB(1) of those Regulations (subscriptions to a junior ISA account) for “£3,600”
substitute “£3,720”.

(1) S.I. 1998/1870. Regulation 4ZA was inserted by S.I. 2011/1780 and amended by S.I. 2012/705. Regulation 4ZB was inserted
by S.I. 2011/1780.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/1870
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1780
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/705
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1780

