
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2013 No. 475

The National Health Service (Charges for Drugs and
Appliances), (Dental Charges) and (Travel Expenses and
Remission of Charges) (Amendment) Regulations 2013

Amendment of the Dental Charges Regulations

16.—(1)  The Dental Charges Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 4 (calculation of charges)—

(a) in paragraph (1), for “£17.50” substitute “£18.00”;
(b) in paragraph (2), for “£48.00” substitute “£49.00”;
(c) in paragraph (3), for “£209.00” substitute “£214.00”;
(d) in paragraph (4), for “£209.00” substitute “£214.00”; and
(e) in paragraph (5), for “£17.50” substitute “£18.00”.

(3)  In regulation 13A(1) (charges in respect of primary dental services provided under a
Capitation and Quality Scheme 2 Agreement), in paragraph (2) for “£17.50” substitute “£18.00”.

(1) Regulation 13A is inserted by S.I. 2013/364.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/364

