Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2013 No. 558

The Social Security (Contributions) (Limits and
Thresholds) (Amendment) Regulations 2013

Amendments to the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001

4. In regulation 11 (prescribed equivalents)—
(a) in paragraph (2A)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£3,540” substitute “£3,454”; and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£42,475” substitute “£41,450”;
(b) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£634” substitute “£646”; and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£7,605” substitute “£7,755”;
(c) in paragraph (3A)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£624” substitute “£641”; and
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£7,488” substitute “£7,696”.



