Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 147

The Welfare Benefits Up-rating Order 2014

Prescribed amounts for the ESA Regulations 2013

12.—(1) In regulation 62 of the ESA Regulations 2013 (prescribed amounts)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a) and (b)(i) for “£71.70” substitute “£72.40”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii) for “£56.80” substitute “£57.35”; and
(c) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£28.45” substitute “£28.75”.

(2) Inregulation 62 of the ESA Regulations 2013 (prescribed amounts) as modified by paragraph
12 of Schedule 2 to the Employment and Support Allowance (Transitional Provisions, Housing
Benefit and Council Tax Benefit) (Existing Awards) (No. 2) Regulations 2010(1) as that paragraph is
modified by paragraph 21(10) of Schedule 4 to the Welfare Reform Act 2012 (Commencement No. 9
and Transitional and Transitory Provisions and Commencement No. 8 and Savings and Transitional
Provisions (Amendment)) Order 2013(2)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a)(i) and (ii)(aa) for “£71.70” substitute “£72.40”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(a)(ii)(bb) for “£56.80” substitute “£57.35”.

(1) S.I.2010/1907 (“the 2010 Regulations”). The 2010 Regulations modify the ESA Regulations 2008 for the purpose of the
conversion of awards of incapacity benefit, income support and severe disablement allowance to employment and support
allowance under the ESA Regulations 2008.

(2) S.. 2013/983. The Welfare Reform Act 2012 (Commencement No. 9 and Transitional and Transitory Provisions and
Commencement No. 8 and Savings and Transitional Provisions (Amendment)) Order 2013 modifies the 2010 Regulations
so that they refer to a modified form of the ESA Regulations 2013 for the purpose of the conversion of awards of incapacity
benefit and severe disablement allowance to employment and support allowance under the ESA Regulations 2013.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/1907
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/983

