
Document Generated: 2024-04-21
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE

THE NURSING AND MIDWIFERY COUNCIL (FEES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2014
The Nursing and Midwifery Council makes the following Rules in exercise of the powers conferred
by articles 7(1) and (2), 33(7)(a) and 47(2) of the Nursing and Midwifery Order 2001(1).
The Nursing and Midwifery Council has consulted in accordance with articles 7(3) and 47(3) of
that Order.

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Nursing and Midwifery Council (Fees) (Amendment) Rules
2014 and shall come into force on 1st February 2015.

Amendment to the Nursing and Midwifery Council (Fees) Rules 2004

2. In the table in rule 3 (fees) of the Nursing and Midwifery Council (Fees) Rules 2004(2)—
(a) in the entry in column (3) of rows (a), (e), (f) and (i), for “£100” substitute “£120”;
(b) in the entry in column (3) of row (b), for “£133” substitute “£153”.

(1) S.I. 2002/253; to which there are amendments not relevant to these Rules.
(2) Scheduled to S.I. 2004/1654, as amended by S.I. 2005/3353, S.I. 2007/1885 and 3101, S.I. 2011/2297 and S.I. 2012/3026.

1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/253
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/1654
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3353
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/1885
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/3101
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2297
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/3026

