
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 448

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed
Requirements) (England) (Amendment) Regulations 2014

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements) (England)
Regulations 2012

2.—(1)  The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements) (England) Regulations
2012(1) are amended as follows.

(2)  In Schedule 2 (applicable amounts)—
(a) in column (2) of the Table in paragraph 1, in sub-paragraph (3)(b) for “£82.50” substitute

“£78.15”;
(b) in paragraph 3 for “£17.40” substitute “£17.45”.

(1) S.I. 2012/2885; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2012/3085, 2013/3181.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/2885
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/3085
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/3181

