
Status: Point in time view as at 09/05/2017. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social

Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2015 (revoked), Section 11. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 457

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2015 (revoked)

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Rates of age addition

11.—[F1(1)  Subject to paragraph (2), in regulation 10(2) of the Social Security (Incapacity
Benefit) Regulations 1994 (increase in rate of incapacity benefit where beneficiary is under
prescribed age on the qualifying date)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£21.25” substitute “ £21.50 ”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£10.65” substitute “ £10.80 ”.

(2)  In the case of a claimant entitled to long-term incapacity benefit the sums specified in
regulation 10(2)(a) and (b) shall be increased to “£11.15” and “£6.20” respectively.]

Textual Amendments
F1 Instrument revoked (except for arts. 16, 17(10)(a), 20) (9.5.2017) by The Social Security Benefits Up-

rating Order 2017 (S.I. 2017/260), art. 29(a)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/457
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/260
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/260
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/260/article/29/a


Status: 
Point in time view as at 09/05/2017. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
Order 2015 (revoked), Section 11.


