
Status: Point in time view as at 03/03/2015. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social

Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2015 (revoked), Section 9. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 457

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2015 (revoked)

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Increase in rates of Disability Living Allowance

9. In regulation 4 of the Social Security (Disability Living Allowance) Regulations 1991 M1 (rate
of benefit)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£81.30” substitute “ £82.30 ”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£54.45” substitute “ £55.10 ”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(c) for “£21.55” substitute “ £21.80 ”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£56.75” substitute “ £57.45 ”; and
(e) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£21.55” substitute “ £21.80 ”.

Marginal Citations
M1 S.I. 1991/2890; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1993/1939 and 2014/516.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2890
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1939


Status: 
Point in time view as at 03/03/2015. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
Order 2015 (revoked), Section 9.


