
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 577

The Social Security (Contributions) (Limits and
Thresholds) (Amendment) Regulations 2015

Amendments to the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001

3. In Regulation 10 (earnings limits and thresholds)—
(a) for “section 5(1)” substitute “sections 5(1) and 9A”;
(b) for “2014” substitute “2015”;
(c) in paragraph (a) (lower earnings limit: primary Class 1 contributions) for “£111” substitute

“£112”;
(d) in paragraph (b) (upper earnings limit: primary Class 1 contributions) for “£805” substitute

“£815”;
(e) in paragraph (c) (primary threshold: primary Class 1 contributions) for “£153” substitute

“£155”;
(f) after paragraph (c) omit “and”;
(g) in paragraph (d) (secondary threshold: secondary Class 1 contributions) for “£153”

substitute “£156”; and
(h) after paragraph (d) insert—

“; and
(e) the upper secondary threshold for secondary Class 1 contributions in relation to

the Under 21 group (for the upper limit of the age-related secondary percentage)
shall be £815”.


