
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 611

The Firearms (Variation of Fees) Order 2015

Amendment to fees for registration as a firearms dealer

3.—(1)  Section 35 of the 1968 Act(1) (fee for registration and renewal as a firearms dealer) is
amended as follows.

(2)  In subsection (1), for “£150” substitute “£200”.
(3)  In subsection (1A), for “£12” substitute “£13”.
(4)  In subsection (3), for “£150” substitute “£200”.

(1) Section 35 was amended by S.I. 1986/986, S.I. 1986/996, S.I. 1990/290, S.I. 1990/325, S.I. 1994/2615, S.I. 1994/2652 and
S.I. 2000/3148.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/986
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/996
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1990/290
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1990/325
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/2615
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/2652
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/3148

