
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to The
Value Added Tax (Increase of Registration Limits) Order 2015. Any changes that have already been made by the team

appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 750

The Value Added Tax (Increase of
Registration Limits) Order 2015

Amendment of the Value Added Tax Act 1994

4. In Schedule 3 (registration in respect of acquisitions from other member states)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1) and (2), for “£81,000” substitute “£82,000”; and
(b) in paragraph 2(1)(a), (1)(b) and (2), for “£81,000” substitute “£82,000”.

Commencement Information
I1 Art. 4 in force at 1.4.2015, see art. 1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/750/article/1


Changes to legislation: 
There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to The Value
Added Tax (Increase of Registration Limits) Order 2015. Any changes that have already been
made by the team appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Instrument associated Parts and
Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Instrument (including any effects on those
provisions):
– reg. 2(1) words inserted by S.I. 2021/169 reg. 6(2)
– reg. 13(1) words substituted by S.I. 2021/169 reg. 6(3)(a)
– reg. 13(1)(b) words substituted by S.I. 2021/169 reg. 6(3)(b)
– reg. 13(2) words substituted by S.I. 2021/169 reg. 6(3)(c)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169/regulation/6/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169/regulation/6/3/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169/regulation/6/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/169/regulation/6/3/c

