
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 272

The National Assembly for Wales (Representation
of the People) (Amendment) Order 2016

PART 3
Other amendments

Limitation of candidates’ expenses

13.—(1)  Amend article 47(3) (constituency and individual candidates: limitation of election
expenses) as follows.

(2)  In sub-paragraph (a)(i)—
(a) omit “which is coterminous with a parliamentary constituency”(1);
(b) for “£7,150” substitute “£8,700”; and
(c) for “7p” substitute “9p”.

(3)  In sub-paragraph (a)(ii)—
(a) omit “which is coterminous with a parliamentary constituency”;
(b) for “£7,150” substitute “£8,700”; and
(c) for “5p” substitute “6p”.

(1) By virtue of section 2 of the Government of Wales Act 2006 (c. 32) Assembly constituencies are the constituencies specified
in S.I. 2006/1041 as amended by S.I. 2008/1791 and an Order in Council under the Parliamentary Constituencies Act 1986
(c. 56) giving effect to an order under section 13(4) or (5) of the Parliamentary Voting Systems and Constituencies Act 2011
(c. 1) (such an order, S.I. 2011/2987, has been made). As a result of amendments made to S.I. 2006/1041 by S.I. 2011/2987
Assembly constituencies and Parliamentary constituencies are no longer coterminous. Assembly constituencies continue to
be specified however by reference to whether they are county or borough constituencies.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1041
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1791
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1986/56
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1986/56
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2987
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1041
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2987

