
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 365

The Value Added Tax (Increase of
Registration Limits) Order 2016

Amendment of the Value Added Tax Act 1994

3. In Schedule 1 (registration in respect of taxable supplies: UK establishment)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1)(a), (1)(b), (2)(a) and (2)(b), for “£82,000” substitute “£83,000”;
(b) in paragraph 1(3), for “£80,000” substitute “81,000”; and
(c) in paragraph 4(1) and (2), for “£80,000” substitute “£81,000”.


