
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 621

The Registrar of Companies (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2016

Amendment to the Fees Regulations 2012

5.—(1)  Schedule 1 is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph 4 for sub-paragraph (1) substitute—

“(1)  In this Schedule in relation to a company or a limited liability partnership a “relevant
period” means one of the following periods—

(a) the period of 12 months beginning with the day of the company’s or limited
liability partnership’s incorporation; or

(b) each period of 12 months beginning with the day after the end of the previous
relevant period.”

(3)  In paragraph 8(a)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£15.00” substitute “£12.00”.
(4)  In paragraph 8(a)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£13.00” substitute “£10.00”.
(5)  In paragraph 8(a) omit paragraph (vi).
(6)  In paragraph 8 for sub-paragraph (f) and the fees specified in relation to that sub-paragraph

in the second column (amount of fee) substitute—

“(f) for the registration of all relevant documents in respect of a company
delivered during a relevant period payable on the registration of a
confirmation statement under section 853A of the 2006 Act with a
confirmation date that falls within the relevant period, unless a confirmation
statement with a confirmation date that falls within the same relevant period
has been registered—

(i) where the confirmation statement is delivered in hard copy form, £40.00

(ii) where the confirmation statement is delivered by electronic means; £13.00”

(7)  In paragraph 8 for sub-paragraph (h) and the fees specified in relation to that sub-paragraph
in the second column (amount of fee) substitute—

“(h) for the registration of a charge under Part 25 of the 2006 Act—

(i) where the required documents are delivered in hard copy form, £23.00

(ii) where the required documents are delivered by electronic means; £15.00”

(8)  In paragraph 10(a)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£13.00” substitute “£10.00”.
(9)  In paragraph 10 for sub-paragraph (b) and the fees specified in relation to that sub-paragraph

in the second column (amount of fee) substitute—



Document Generated: 2024-01-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“(b) for the registration of all relevant documents in respect of a limited liability
partnership delivered during a relevant period payable on the registration of
a confirmation statement under section 853A of the 2006 Act as applied to
limited liability partnerships by regulation 30 of the LLP Regulations with a
confirmation date that falls within the relevant period, unless a confirmation
statement with a confirmation date that falls within the same relevant period
has been registered—

(i) where the confirmation statement is delivered in hard copy form, £40.00

(ii) where the confirmation statement is delivered by electronic means; £13.00”

(10)  In paragraph 10 for sub-paragraph (d) and the fees specified in relation to that sub-paragraph
in the second column (amount of fee) substitute—

“(d) for the registration of a charge under Part 25 of the 2006 Act as applied to
limited liability partnerships by Part 9 of the LLP Regulations—

(i) where the required documents are delivered in hard copy form, £23.00

(ii) where the required documents are delivered by electronic means; £15.00”

2


