Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 621

The Registrar of Companies (Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2016

Amendment to the Fees Regulations 2012
6.—(1) Schedule 2 is amended as follows.

(2) Inparagraph 1 in the definition of “Companies House Information Centre” after ““’searchroom
terminal’™” omit “means a computer terminal operated by an applicant at a CHIC;” and insert “means
a computer terminal through which information is accessed by an applicant by means of an access
card at a CHIC;”.

(3) In paragraph 1 in the definition of “WebCHeck” after “registrar” insert “at http://
wck2.companieshouse.gov.uk”.

(4) In paragraph 7(j)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(5) In paragraph 7(j)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(6) In paragraph 7(j)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00 substitute “£15.00”.
(7) In paragraph 7(j)(iv) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(8) In paragraph 7(k)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(9) In paragraph 7(k)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(10) In paragraph 7(1)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(11) Inparagraph 7(I)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.

(12) In paragraph 11(j) in the first column (matter in relation to which fee is payable) after
“terminal” insert “or any other computer”.

(13) In paragraph 11(k)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.

(14) In paragraph 11(k)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute
“£50.00”.

(15) Inparagraph 11(1)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(16) In paragraph 11(1)(iii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(17) Inparagraph 11(m)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.

(18) In paragraph 11(m)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute
“£50.00”.

(19) In paragraph 11(n)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(20) Inparagraph 11(n)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(21) Inparagraph 12(m)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.

(22) In paragraph 12(m)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute
“£50.00”.

(23) Inparagraph 12(n)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(24) Inparagraph 12(n)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.

(3713



Document Generated: 2024-01-17

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(25) Inparagraph 12(0)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(26) In paragraph 12(0)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.
(27) In paragraph 12(p)(i) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£20.00” substitute “£15.00”.
(28) Inparagraph 12(p)(ii) in the second column (amount of fee) for “£60.00” substitute “£50.00”.



