
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 928

The First-tier Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum
Chamber) Fees (Amendment) Order 2016

Amendment of the First-tier Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) Fees Order 2011

4. In article 3 (fees for appeals)—
(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£80” substitute “£490”;
(b) in paragraph (3)(b), for “£140” substitute “£800”; and
(c) after paragraph (5) insert—

“(5A)  Where a notice of decision against which the appellant is appealing contains
more than one appealable decision, one fee is payable in respect of each appealable
decision that is not exempt under article 5”.


