
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 22

The Legal Services Act 2007 (Claims Management
Complaints) (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Amendments to the Legal Services Act 2007 (Claims Management Complaints) (Fees)
Regulations 2014

2.—(1)  The Schedule to the Legal Services Act 2007 (Claims Management Complaints) (Fees)
Regulations 2014(1) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph 3—
(a) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£154,286.00” substitute “£157,143.00”;
(b) in table 2—

(i) in column 1, for “154,286.00” substitute “157,143.00”, and
(ii) in column 2—

(aa) for “105.00” substitute “75.00”;
(bb) for “210.00” substitute “150.00”;
(cc) for “350.00” substitute “250.00”;
(dd) for “476.00” substitute “340.00”, and
(ee) for “756.00” substitute “550.00”;

(c) in sub-paragraph (3)—
(i) for “£154,286.00” substitute “£157,143.00”;

(ii) in paragraph (a), for “0.49%” substitute “0.35%”;
(iii) in paragraph (b), for “0.33%” substitute “0.25%”, and
(iv) in paragraph (c), for “0.27%” substitute “0.2%”, and

(d) in sub-paragraph (4), for “£59,950.00” substitute “£50,000.00”.
(3)  In paragraph 4(3), for “£4,996.00” substitute “£4166.00”.

(1) S.I. 2014/3316 amended by S.I. 2016/92.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/3316
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/92

