
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 368

The Energy Performance of Buildings (England
and Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Amendment of regulation 28

3. In regulation 28 (fees for entering data onto the register)—
(a) in paragraph (a) for “£2.07” substitute “£1.82”; and
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£12.82” substitute “£10.12”.


