
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 1107

The Police Act 1997 (Criminal Records)
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2019

Amendments to the Police Act 1997 (Criminal Records) Regulations 2002

2.—(1)  The Police Act 1997 (Criminal Records) Regulations 2002(1) are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 3A (fee for criminal conviction certificates), for “£25” substitute “£23”.
(3)  In regulation 4 (fees for criminal record certificates and enhanced criminal record certificates)

—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£26” substitute “£23”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£44” substitute “£40”.

(1) S.I. 2002/233. Regulation 3A was inserted by S.I 2014/239. Regulation 4 was substituted by S.I. 2003/1418 and 2006/748, and
amended by S.I. 2009/2428 and 2011/719. There are other amending statutory instruments not relevant to these regulations.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/233
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/1418
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/748
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/2428
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/719

