
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Oil and Gas Authority (Levy) and Pollution
Prevention and Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2019, PART 3. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 439

The Oil and Gas Authority (Levy) and Pollution Prevention and
Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2019

PART 3
Pollution Prevention and Control - Fees

Amendments to the Offshore Petroleum Production and Pipe-lines (Assessment of
Environmental Effects) Regulations 1999

F110. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

Textual Amendments
F1 Reg. 10 omitted (31.12.2020 immediately before 11 p.m.) by virtue of The Offshore Oil and Gas

Exploration, Production, Unloading and Storage (Environmental Impact Assessment) Regulations
2020 (S.I. 2020/1497), regs. 1(1), 2(4)(e) (with reg. 1(2)-(6), 20)

Amendments to the Offshore Petroleum Activities (Conservation of Habitats) Regulations
2001

11. In the Offshore Petroleum Activities (Conservation of Habitats) Regulations 2001 M1, in
regulation 20A(2)—

(a) for “£168” substitute “ £183 ”;
(b) for “£82” substitute “ £98 ”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 11 in force at 1.4.2019, see reg. 1

Marginal Citations
M1 S.I. 2001/1754. Regulation 20A is inserted by S.I. 2015/1431 and amended by S.I. 2016/529 and S.I.

2016/1042.

Amendments to the Offshore Petroleum Licensing (Offshore Safety Directive) Regulations
2015

12. In the Offshore Petroleum Licensing (Offshore Safety Directive) Regulations 2015 M2, in
regulation 13A(2)—

(a) for “£168” substitute “ £183 ”;
(b) for “£82” substitute “ £98 ”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/439/regulation/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497/regulation/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497/regulation/2/4/e
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497/regulation/1/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1497/regulation/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/439/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1754
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1431
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/529
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1042
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1042


Document Generated: 2024-05-10
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Oil and Gas Authority (Levy) and Pollution

Prevention and Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2019, PART 3. (See end of Document for details)

Commencement Information
I2 Reg. 12 in force at 1.4.2019, see reg. 1

Marginal Citations
M2 S.I. 2015/385. Regulation 13A is inserted by S.I. 2017/404.

Amendments to the Pollution Prevention and Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments
and Other Provisions) Regulations 2015

13. In the Pollution Prevention and Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments and Other
Provisions) Regulations 2015 M3, in regulation 7(1)—

(a) for “£168” substitute “ £183 ”;
(b) for “£82” substitute “ £98 ”.

Commencement Information
I3 Reg. 13 in force at 1.4.2019, see reg. 1

Marginal Citations
M3 S.I. 2015/1431. This instrument is amended by S.I. 2016/529, S.I. 2016/1042, S.I. 2017/404 and S.I.

2018/311.

2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/439/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/385
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/404
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/439/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1431
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/529
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/529/section/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/404
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/311
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/311


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Oil and Gas Authority (Levy) and
Pollution Prevention and Control (Fees) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2019, PART
3.


