
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 475

The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) (Refund,
Waiver and Amendment) (EU Exit) Regulations 2019

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018

10.—(1)  Schedule 9 (applications in relation to entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man and
premium services) is amended as follows.

(2)  In Table 21 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man)—
(a) in 21.1.1 in the third column for “£93” substitute “£95”;
(b) in 21.1.2 in the third column for “£350” substitute “£361”;
(c) in 21.1.3 in the third column for “£636” substitute “£655”;
(d) in 21.1.4 in the third column for “£798” substitute “£822”;
(e) in 21.1.5 in the third column for “£186” substitute “£190”;
(f) in 21.1.6 in the third column for “£186” substitute “£190”.

(3)  In Table 25 (premium services outside the United Kingdom and the Isle of Man) in 25.2.1
in the third column for “£212” substitute “£220”.


