
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 475

The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) (Refund,
Waiver and Amendment) (EU Exit) Regulations 2019

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018

11.—(1)  Schedule 10 (applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or the
Bailiwick of Jersey and premium services) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph 1—
(a) after “In this Schedule—” insert—

““Guernsey immigration rules” means the rules made by the States of Guernsey
Committee for Home Affairs in respect of the Bailiwick of Guernsey under sections
1(4) and 3(2) of the 1971 Act as extended to that bailiwick(1);
“Jersey immigration rules” means the rules contained in the directions made by the
Minister for Home Affairs in respect of the Bailiwick of Jersey under sections 1(4A)
and 3(2) of the 1971 Act as extended to that bailiwick(2);”;

(b) in the definition of “work permit employment” for paragraph (a) substitute—
“(a)   the Guernsey immigration rules; or”.

(3)  In paragraph 2 after sub-paragraph (1) insert—
“(1A)  Table 26A provides exceptions from the requirement to pay certain fees in respect

of applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or the Bailiwick of
Jersey.”

(4)  In Table 26 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or
the Bailiwick of Jersey)—

(a) in 26.2.1 in the third column for “£93” substitute “£95”;
(b) in 26.2.2 in the third column for “£350” substitute “£361”;
(c) in 26.2.3 in the third column for “£636” substitute “£655”;
(d) in 26.2.4 in the third column for “£798” substitute “£822”;
(e) in 26.4.1 in the second column at the end insert “, other than an application for entry

clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Jersey to which 26.4.1A applies”;
(f) after 26.4.1 insert—

(1) Sections 1 and 3 of the Immigration Act 1971 (c. 77) were extended with modifications to the Bailiwick of Guernsey by
article 3 of, and paragraphs 1 and 3 of Schedule 1 to, S.I. 1993/1796. The rules made under section 1(4) and 3(2) are the
Immigration (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Rules, 2008 (Guernsey Statutory Instrument No. 26 of 2008), as most recently amended
by Guernsey Statutory Instrument No. 17 of 2019.

(2) Sections 1 and 3 of the Immigration Act 1971 were extended with modifications to the Bailiwick of Jersey by article 3 of,
and paragraphs 1 and 3 of Schedule 1 to, S.I. 1993/1797 as amended by S.I. 2017/981. For the Jersey immigration rules see
www.gov.je/SiteCollectionDocuments/Life%20events/LD%20IMMIGRATION%20RULES%20TL.pdf.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1971/77
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1796
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1797
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/981
http://www.gov.je/SiteCollectionDocuments/Life%20events/LD%20IMMIGRATION%20RULES%20TL.pdf


Document Generated: 2023-08-12
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“26.4.1A Application for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Jersey for
the purposes of unskilled seasonal work permit employment for a
period of 9 months or less.

£244”

(5)  After Table 26 insert—

“Table 26A (Exceptions in respect of fees for applications for entry
clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or the Bailiwick of Jersey)

Number and description of the exception Fees to
which
exception
applies

26A.1 Applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey for the
purposes of an application under Appendix EU to the Guernsey immigration
rules

26A.1.1 No fee is payable in respect of an application for entry clearance
to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey made for the purposes of an
application under Appendix EU to the Guernsey immigration rules for
leave to enter or leave to remain in that bailiwick.

Fees 26.1.1,
26.2.1,
26.4.2

26A.2 Applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Jersey for the purposes
of an application under Appendix EU(J) to the Jersey immigration rules

26A.2.1 No fee is payable in respect of an application for entry clearance to
enter the Bailiwick of Jersey made for the purposes of an application
under Appendix EU(J) to the Jersey immigration rules for leave to
enter or leave to remain in that bailiwick.

Fees 26.1.1,
26.2.1,
26.4.2

26A.3 Applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Jersey under Appendix
EU(J) (Family Permit) to the Jersey immigration rules

26A.3.1 No fee is payable in respect of an application for entry clearance to
enter the Bailiwick of Jersey made under Appendix EU(J) (Family
Permit) to the Jersey immigration rules.

Fees 26.1.1,
26.2.1,
26.4.2”

(6)  In paragraph 4 at the end insert “, subject to the exceptions in Table 26A”.
(7)  In Table 27 (premium services outside the United Kingdom and the relevant bailiwick) in

27.2.1 in the third column for “£212” substitute “£220”.

2


