Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 475

The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) (Refund,
Waiver and Amendment) (EU Exit) Regulations 2019

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018
8.—(1) Schedule 6 (premium services in the United Kingdom) is amended as follows.
(2) In paragraph 1 omit the definition of “super premium service”.
(3) In Table 17 (premium services in the United Kingdom)—
(a) in 17.1.1 in the third column for “£477” substitute “£500”;
(b) in 17.1.2 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£800”;
(c) omit 17.2,17.2.2,17.4 and 17.4.1;
(d) in 17.5.1 in the third column for “£3.90” substitute “£5.20”;
(e) omit 17.7.1;
(f) at the end insert—

“17.7.2  The provision, to a person other than a government department, £77.40 per
of an immigration officer to provide any premium service relating hour  per

to entry into or transit through the United Kingdom. officer
17.7.3 The provision, to a government department, of an immigration officer £57.33  per
to provide any premium service relating to entry into or transit hour per

through the United Kingdom. officer”




