Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 1029

The Health Protection (Coronavirus, Restrictions) (No. 2)
(England) (Amendment) (No. 5) Regulations 2020

Amendment of the Health Protection (Coronavirus, Restrictions) (North of England)
Regulations 2020

4.—(1) The Health Protection (Coronavirus, Restrictions) (North of England) Regulations
2020(1) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 3—
(a) in paragraph (1), omit the definition of “person responsible for carrying on a business”;
(b) omit paragraph (3).
(3) Omit regulation 4(4)(c).
(4) Omit regulation 7A.
(5) Inregulation 8—
(a) in paragraph (1), omit “or 7A”;
(b) omit paragraph (1A);
(c) in paragraph (9)(b), at the end insert “or”;
(d) in paragraph (9)(c), omit the “or” at the end;
(e) omit paragraph (9)(d);
(f) omit paragraph (10).
(6) In regulation 9—
(a) in paragraph (1), omit “7A,”;
(b) omit paragraphs (4A) and (4B).
(7) Inregulation 10—
(a) in paragraph (3),
(1) omit sub-paragraph (a);
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), omit “, or by the relevant local authority,”;
(b) in paragraph (6), for “£100” substitute “£200”;
(c) in paragraph (7), for “£50” substitute “£100”;
(d) in paragraph (8)(b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£200” substitute “£400”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£400” substitute “£800”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for £800” substitute “£1,6007;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for £1,600” substitute “£3,200”;

(1) S.I. 2020/828, as amended by S.I. 2020/846, 865>, 931, 954, 974, 986, 1010 and 1019. The title of the Regulations was
changed by S.I. 2020/865.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/828
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/846
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/865
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/931
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/954
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/974
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/986
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1010
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1019
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/865

Document Generated: 2024-01-25

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

(v) in paragraph (v), for £3,200” substitute “£6,400”;
(e) in paragraph (9A), for “regulation 5A or 5B”, substitute “regulation 4A, 4B, 5A or 5B”;
(f) omit paragraph (12)(a)(i);
(g) in paragraph (13), omit—
(1) sub-paragraph (a)(iv);
(i1) sub-paragraph (b);
(h) omit paragraph (14).
(8) In regulation 12, omit “or (d)”.
(9) Omit the Schedule.



