
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 1045

The Health Protection (Coronavirus, Restrictions)
(Self-Isolation) (England) Regulations 2020

PART 1

Amendment of the Health Protection (Coronavirus, Collection of Contact Details etc and
Related Requirements) Regulations 2020

4. The Health Protection (Coronavirus, Collection of Contact Details etc and Related
Requirements) Regulations 2020(1) are amended as follows—

(a) in regulation 4 (interpretation), in the definition of “local authority”, in paragraph (b) omit
the words “for an area in which there is no County Council”;

(b) in regulation 14 (requirement to retain and disclose details), after “Secretary of State”
insert “or a Public Health Officer”;

(c) in regulation 17 (offences and penalties)—
(i) in paragraph (1)(g), for “regulation 15” substitute “regulation 14”,

(ii) after paragraph (1)(g), as so amended, insert “; (h) regulation 16”;
(d) in regulation 18 (fixed penalty notices)—

(i) in paragraph (7)(b), for “£3000”, substitute “£4000”,
(ii) in paragraph 7(c), for “£4000”, substitute “£10,000”,

(iii) in paragraph (8), for “relevant” substitute “specified”;
(e) in the Schedule (Listed Services), in paragraph 2(i), insert “including gyms” after “leisure

centres”.

(1) S.I. 2020/1005.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1005

