
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 1335

The National Health Service (Dental
Charges) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Amendment of the National Health Service (Dental Charges) Regulations 2005

2.—(1)  The National Health Service (Dental Charges) Regulations 2005(1) are amended as
follows.

(2)  In regulation 4 (calculation of charges)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£22.70” substitute “£23.80”;
(b) in paragraph (2), for “£62.10” substitute “£65.20”;
(c) in paragraph (3), for “£269.30” substitute “£282.80”;
(d) in paragraph (4), for “£269.30” substitute “£282.80”; and
(e) in paragraph (5), for “£22.70” substitute “£23.80”.

(3)  In regulation 12A (charges in respect of primary dental services provided under a prototype
agreement), in paragraph (2) for “£22.70” substitute “£23.80”.

(1) S.I. 2005/3477; as amended by S.I. 2006/1837, 2007/544, 2008/547, 2009/407, 2011/519, 2012/502, 2013/364, 475 and 711,
2014/443 and 545, 2015/417 and 1728, 2016/324, 2017/408, 2018/336, 2019/522 and 2020/885.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3477
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/1837
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/544
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/547
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/407
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/519
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/502
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/364
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/475
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/711
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/443
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/545
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/417
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1728
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/324
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/408
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/336
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/522
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/885

