
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 1369

The Greenhouse Gas Emissions Trading Scheme
(Withdrawal Agreement) (EU Exit) Regulations 2020

PART 2
Implementation of withdrawal agreement in relation

to electricity generation in Northern Ireland from 2021

Failure to comply with a condition of a permit

18. In regulation 53—
(a) in paragraph (1)

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) omit “(but excluding the condition mentioned in paragraph (4)
below)”,

(ii) in sub-paragraph (c) for “regulation 88(6) or (7)” substitute “regulation 88”(1);
(b) in paragraph (3)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£3,750” substitute “£20,000”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (b)—

(aa) for “£375” substitute “£500”,
(bb) for “£33,750” substitute “£45,000”;

(c) omit paragraph (4).

(1) Regulation 88 is to be substituted by regulation 27 of S.I. 2019/1440.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/1440

