
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 472

The Criminal Legal Aid (Coronavirus,
Remuneration) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Amendment of the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013

2.—(1)  The Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013(1) are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 21 (hardship payments)—

(a) in paragraph (2)(b), for “six months” substitute “one month”; and
(b) in paragraph (6), for “£5,000” substitute “£450”.

(1) S.I. 2013/435, to which there are amendments not relevant to these Regulations.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/435

