Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 1348

The Education (Student Fees, Awards and
Support) (Amendment) (No. 3) Regulations 2021

PART 3

Corresponding amendments to other Regulations
CHAPTER 6

Amendment of the Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans and the
Education (Student Loans) (Repayment) (Amendment) (No 2) etc.) Regulations 2018

SECTION 9

Amounts of loan

Amount of the postgraduate doctoral degree loan

64. In regulation 12(1)(a)(1) for “£27,265” substitute “£27,892”.

Payment of postgraduate doctoral degree loans
65. In regulation 13(4)(2) for “£11,570” substitute “£11,836”.

(1) Figure substituted by S.I. 2020/1203.
(2) Figure substituted by S.I. 2020/1203.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1203
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1203

