
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 329

The National Minimum Wage (Amendment) Regulations 2021

Amendments to the National Minimum Wage Regulations 2015

2.—(1)  The National Minimum Wage Regulations 2015(1) are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 4 (the national living wage) for “£8.72” substitute “£8.91”.
(3)  In regulation 4A(1) (workers who qualify for the national minimum wage at a different rate)—

(a) for “£8.20” substitute “£8.36”;
(b) for “25 years” substitute “23 years”;
(c) for “£6.45” substitute “£6.56”;
(d) for “£4.55” substitute “£4.62”;
(e) for “£4.15” substitute “£4.30”.

(4)  In regulation 16(1) (amount for provision of living accommodation) for “£8.20” substitute
“£8.36”.

(5)  In regulation 59(8) (records to be kept by an employer) for “three years” substitute “six years”.

(1) S.I. 2015/621; the relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2015/1724, S.I. 2016/68, S.I. 2016/953, S.I. 2017/465, S.I. 2018/455,
S.I. 2019/603, S.I. 2020/338 and S.I. 2020/339.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/621
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1724
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/68
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/953
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/465
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/455
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/603
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/338
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/339

