Document Generated: 2023-12-08
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 1

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018
increasing the amount of specified fees and deductions from specified fees

2.—(1) Schedule 1 (applications for entry clearance to enter, and leave to enter, the United
Kingdom) is amended as follows.

(2) In Table 1 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom)—

(a) in 1.1.1 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”;

(b) in 1.1.2 in the third column for “£361” substitute “£376”;

(¢) in 1.1.3 in the third column for “£655” substitute “£670”;

(d) in 1.1.4 in the third column for “£822” substitute “£837”;

(e) in 1.1.5 and 1.1.6 in the third column for “£190 substitute “£200”;
(f) in 1.1.8 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”;

(g) in 1.2.2 in the third column for “£186” substitute “£200”;

(h) in 1.3.4 in the third column for “£1,021” substitute “£1,036”;

(1) in 1.3.6 in the third column for “£1,623” substitute “£1,638”;

() in 1.3.6A in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625;

(k) in 1.3.6B in the third column for “£1,220” substitute “£1,235”;

(1) in 1.3.6C in the third column for “£464” substitute “£479”;
(m) in 1.3.6D in the third column for “£928” substitute “£943”;

(n) in 1.3.6E in the third column for “£482” substitute “£497”;

(o) in 1.3.6F and 1.3.6G in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”;
(p) in 1.3.6H in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”;

(@) in 1.3.11A in the third column for “£348” substitute “£363”;

(r) in 1.3A.1 in the third column for £1,021” substitute “£1,036”;

(s) in 1.3A.2 in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”;

(t) in 1.3B.2 in the third column for “£152” substitute “£167”;

(u) in 1.3B.3 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”;

(v) in 1.4.4 in the third column for “£1,523” substitute “£1,538”;
(w) 1in 1.4.6 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625;

(x) in 1.4.7 in the third column for “£1,033” substitute “£1,048”;

(y) in 1.5.1 in the third column for “£516” substitute “£531”.

(3) In Table 2 (specified fees for dependants)—

(a) in 2.1.1 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”;

(b) in 2.1.1A in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”;

(c) in 2.1.6 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”.

(4) In Table 3 (fee for applications for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter the United
Kingdom — dependants of members of HM Forces) in 3.1.1 in the third column for “£2,389”
substitute “£2,404”.

(5) In paragraph 3A (reduction of fees for Health and Care Visa applications and related
applications by dependants)—



Document Generated: 2023-12-08
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) in sub-paragraph (2) for paragraph (c) substitute—
“(¢) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6C of that Table;
(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6D of that Table.”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (3) for paragraph (c) substitute—
“(¢) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6C of that Table;
(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6D of that Table.”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for paragraph (c) substitute—
“(¢) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.9 of that Table as it continues
to have effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph 2(4)

of Schedule 2 to the Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services
Commissioner (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022);

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.10 of that Table as it continues
to have effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph
2(5) of Schedule 2 to Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services
Commissioner (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022.”



