
Document Generated: 2023-12-08
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 1

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018
increasing the amount of specified fees and deductions from specified fees

6.—(1)  Schedule 10 (applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or the
Bailiwick of Jersey and premium services) is amended as follows.

(2)  In Table 26 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or
the Bailiwick of Jersey)—

(a) in 26.1.1 in the third column for “£516” substitute “£531”;
(b) in 26.2.1 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”;
(c) in 26.2.2 in the third column for “£361” substitute “£376”;
(d) in 26.2.3 in the third column for “£655” substitute “£670”;
(e) in 26.2.4 in the third column for “£822” substitute “£837”;
(f) in 26.3.1 in the third column for “£348” substitute “£363”;
(g) in 26.4.1 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”;
(h) in 26.4.1ZA in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”;
(i) in 26.4.1A in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”;
(j) in 26.4.2 in the third column for “£1,523” substitute “£1,538”.

(3)  In Table 27 (premium services outside the United Kingdom and the relevant bailiwick) in
27.2.1 in the third column for “£220” substitute “£250”.

1


