
Document Generated: 2024-07-26
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Criminal Legal

Aid (Remuneration) (Amendment) Regulations 2022, Paragraph 11. (See end of Document for details)

SCHEDULE 4

Amendments to Schedule 4 to the Remuneration Regulations

11.—(1)  Paragraph 8 is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph 8(a), for “£273.75” substitute “£314.81”.
(3)  In paragraph 8(b), for “£456.25” substitute “£524.69”.
(4)  For the table following paragraph 8 (advice and assistance on an appeal against conviction

or sentence or application to the criminal cases review commission), substitute—

“Advice and Assistance on an appeal against conviction or
sentence or application to the Criminal Cases Review Commission

London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and
routine telephone calls per item

4.04 3.89

Preparation hourly rate 52.15 49.22

Travel and waiting hourly rate 27.60 27.60”

Commencement Information
I1 Sch. 4 para. 11 in force at 30.9.2022, see reg. 1(1)

1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/848/schedule/4/paragraph/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/848/regulation/1/1


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration)
(Amendment) Regulations 2022, Paragraph 11.


