
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 15

IMMIGRATION
NATIONALITY

PASSPORTS

The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) and
Passport (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Made       -      -      -      -
at 10.30 a.m. on 11th

January 2023

Laid before Parliament 
at 4.00 p.m. on 11th

January 2023
Coming into force in accordance with
regulation 1(2)

THE IMMIGRATION AND NATIONALITY (FEES) AND
PASSPORT (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2023

1. Citation, commencement and extent  
2. Amendments to Schedule 2 to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees)

Regulations 2018
 

3. Amendments to the Schedule to the Passport (Fees) Regulations 2022  
  Signature  

SCHEDULE — AMENDMENTS TO THE SCHEDULE TO THE PASSPORT
(FEES) REGULATIONS 2022

1. For the table in paragraph 2 substitute— Category of prospective...  
2. For paragraph 3 substitute— (1) This paragraph and paragraph 4 apply

where the application...
 

3. In paragraph 4, for the words from “relevant” to the...  
4. In paragraph 7, for “£10” substitute “£11”.  
5. For paragraph 8 substitute— (1) This paragraph and paragraph 9 apply

where the application...
 

6. In paragraph 9, for the words from “relevant” to the...  
7. In paragraph 10, for “£10” substitute “£11”.  
8. In paragraph 11, for “£10” substitute “£11”.  



Document Generated: 2023-01-11
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

9. For the table in paragraph 12 substitute— Category of prospective...  

  Explanatory Note  


