
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 314

The Medicines (Products for Human Use)
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of regulation 15

12. In regulation 15 (fees for applications for certificates and copy certificates by exporters of
medicinal products)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£152” substitute “£167”,
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£68” substitute “£75”, and
(c) in paragraph (3), for “£34” substitute “£37”.


