
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 314

The Medicines (Products for Human Use)
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of regulation 27

20. In regulation 27 (fees for renewals of certain manufacturer’s licences)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£178” substitute “£196”, and
(b) in paragraph (3), for “£295” substitute “£325”.


