STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 372
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers” Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Made - - - - 27th March 2023

Coming into force - - Ist April 2023

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations, in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before, and approved by a resolution of, each House of
Parliament.

Citation, commencement, application and extent
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2023 and come into force on 1st April 2023.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2023.

(3) These Regulations extend to England and Wales and Scotland.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(c) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma)
for “£3,425” substitute “£3,771”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis) for
“£7,085” (in both places) substitute “£7,801”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£3,425” substitute “£3,771".
(5) In the Schedule—
(a) in the part headed “TABLE 17, for the table substitute—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(c) S.I. 1988/668; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1989/552, S.I. 2013/690, S.1. 2015/503 and S.I. 2022/254.



Y6871 918°CY 1€S°0r 7€0°8¢ €eese (44 a4 TLL'ST 88L°0C OLIGT 0TS°8 19
00€°0S T8y L86'SY 68S°cY 6v0° 11 0€8°LE 0¥Z0g 189°tC TSELT €166 09
969°S¢ T79°€s 1218 SIer 9L9% 60T EY TT1LYVE 9LG°8T 9¢5°61 S6v°01 65
€01°19 ST0°6S 00695 YILYS 18¥°CS €€9°8Y TLT'6E 08¥°CE 1L 1T I8S¥11 8¢
0599 YEY Y9 96€79 TLT09 961°8S 8¥0°vS S N7 YLEOE 668°€T TLY'TI LS
785°89 0S99 YEY Y9 95€T9 T°LT09 €€6°9¢ LSSO¥ 869°6€ 667°9C 9L6°¢1 9¢
1L9°0L 78589 70599 eV 9 95€T9 ¥20°6S Sov'6r LTOEY 101°6C 881Gl Y
SYLTL 1L9°0L 786°89 0S99 YEY Y9 61519 €8€°TS SreE9p 869°1¢ 06691 123
078 VL SYLTL 1L9°0L 78589 0S99 €10'%9 987°GCS 1L9°6Y 86C ¢ 96781 €S
968°9L 0T8 VL SYLTL 1L9°0L 78589 ¥05°99 v61°8S 666CS 068°9¢ ¥00°0¢ [4Y
vIS6L YEL'LL 0S9°SL S6S°EL 667 1L 000°69 61519 081°GS LYE8E 919°1C IS
0TLC8 8€9°08 €9G°8L 88Y°9L YOv L 667 1L 81819 901°LS 08°6€ 9TT'cT 0S
CE9°C8 vSSE8 VLY 18 v6E 6L YIELL S66°¢L TL1'89 8¥S 65 LST'T¥ LESTT (Y4
P7G°88 LSY'98 C8EV8 LOETS €7T08 88Y9L 667 1L TELT9 T1L°TY 8¥¥9C 81
Y16 1L£68 96T°L8 01C°68 I71°€8 786°8L 0T8VvL 806°€9 9911 190°8¢ Ly
L8Y'T6 0¥ 06 PEE 88 GST98 6LTV8 8EY°08 88Y°9L 999°99 LOS'LY 0€6°6C 9%
87S€6 816 1,68 96C°L8 01C°68 768°18 8Y1°8L 91+°69 or¥'1S 008°1¢ 9%
€956 L8YT6 0¥°06 PEE 88 GST98 Srees v18°6L L9TTL 9L0°SS 999°¢€ 144
609°S6 8756 816 1L£68 96C°L8 0878 YLV 18 9T6' VL T1L8S (42993 13917
$9°96 €956 L8YT6 0¥ 06 PEE 88 6GT98 I71°e8 8L9°LL 95€T9 €0v°LE (4%
€TL86 S+9°96 €956 L8Y'T6 Y0¥ 06 PEC’88 01¢c8 8€Y°08 0L¥*S9 869°8¢ 184
#08°001 €TL'86 $9°96 €956 L8YT6 0¥°06 861°L3 L8T°ES 78589 LO6°6€ oy
188°C01 208°001 €TL86 S+9°96 °6T16 161°C6 £89°68 176°C8 €OL 1L 0ST°I+ 6¢
LS6 V01 188201 208001 €TL'86 S+9°96 €956 698°16 769°88 0T8vL L6ETY 8¢
8€0°L01T LS6101 188201 208°001 €TL'86 $9°96 6v0'16 8vv'16 Yv6°LL S¥9'cy | I9punlo /¢

F F F F F F F F F F

%001 - %06~ %08~ WOL~ %09- %OS- %Ot~ WOE- WOC- 4opun 40
BI6 WIS WBIL W19 WIS BIY WIE BIT BIT WOl uosiad
pa1qosip
poriad juvaajad ayj 40f JudUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y,




1€9°91 6611 9LLET 7801 16€°01 T6 'L 89¢€°9 S61°S ILL'E J9A0 10 L/
€0T'L1 949! 9811 ereETI ¢so’ol 9LE°6 00€°L 89%°9 L6T'S 1L8°€¢ 9L
LL°LT 8L6°ST 10971 009°C1 T16°01 (4390 9SH°L SLS9 607°S 8L6EC SL
8TE 81 L6V91 020°S1 798I OLT'T1 769°6 SI9°L 9L9°9 LOS'S 6L0Y VL
v16°'81 610°LI Sev'Sl 12rel eerIl rr8°6 69L°L T8L9 ¥19°C 8LI'Y €L
687°61 €eSLI LY8SI LLEET 769°11 €00°01 ST6'L ¢88°9 SIL'S 88CY L
791°0C 061°81 091 €e0vl T9TTl L1¥°01 LEE'S IL1°L 126°S 81v'Y IL
8¢8°0¢ 7€8°81 06691 78911 6T8°CI 9¢€8°01 9GL'8 9SH'L 9€1°9 9rSy 0L
905°1¢ 68761 19S°L1 €eesl LOVET €STI1 IL1°6 9vLL 0rE9 8Lt 69
981°CT Teroe SEI'8l 8L6ST 9L6°€C1 899°11 165°6 LT0°8 829 €08y 89
€98°CC 88L°0C Y0L'81 1€9°91 €SSyl 780°C1 €00°01 01¢'8 SSL9 6£6'Y L9
881°9C 011%¢ 9L6°1C L6L'61 19S°L1 0L0°ST T9TTl 82001 ¥00°8 65t°S 99
SIS'6¢ LEV'LT ¢sT'se L96°TC SLS0T 090°81 LTSI THL T 1ST°6 LL6'S S9
Ce8TE 9GL°0¢ LTS'8T 6€1°9C 165°€C 1¥0°1C 18L91 8Pl S6v°01 LOS'9 9
S91°9¢ ¥80°t¢ 008°1¢ Y0E°6C 665°9C Se0've 90°61 VANS! YL 910°L €9
16t°6€ €0P'LE LLO'SE 08¢ L19°6C 020°LT 10€°1C L8891 066°C1 €es’L 9




(b) in the part headed “TABLE 2”, for the table (together with the headings to the table)

substitute—

“Part A
Age of Percentage assessment for the relevant period
disabled
person on 10% 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% or over
their last or under £ £ £ £ £
birthday
before their
death
37 or under 27,644 47,134 52,847 54,408 55,704
38 27,021 45,365 51,286 52,847 54,507
39 26,400 43,598 49,728 51,285 53,312
40 25,771 41,827 48,168 49,728 52,117
41 25,148 40,063 46,610 48,168 50,922
42 24,530 38,303 45,049 46,610 49,728
43 23,405 36,015 43,646 45,205 48,584
44 22,291 33,720 42,240 43,804 47,430
45 21,174 31,437 40,838 42,400 46,294
46 20,056 29,148 39,316 40,997 45,152
47 18,939 26,863 38,040 39,599 44,011
48 18,085 26,238 37,000 38,506 42,609
49 17,221 25,613 35,958 37,414 41,202
50 16,367 24,989 34,922 36,316 39,801
51 15,512 24,367 33,882 35,232 38,403
52 14,654 23,747 32,842 34,140 37,000
53 14,261 22,291 30,870 32,631 35,851
54 13,873 20,834 28,890 31,125 34,712
55 13,485 19,379 26,916 29,620 33,569
56 13,096 17,925 24,940 28,115 32,418
57 12,472 16,474 22,967 26,606 31,278
58 11,481 15,429 20,711 23,959 28,115
59 10,495 14,389 18,451 21,303 24,940
60 9,513 13,358 16,185 18,654 21,774
61 8,520 12,314 13,928 16,005 18,604
62 7,533 11,280 11,664 13,358 15,429
63 7,016 11,199 11,513 12,856 14,524
64 6,507 10,495 11,350 12,366 13,625
65 5,977 9,251 11,199 11,871 12,703
66 5,459 8,004 10,028 11,380 11,796
67 or over 3,771 5,195 6,368 7,142 9,222

Part B

Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £
before their death

37 or under 55,704
38 54,507
39 53,312
40 52,117




41 50,922
42 49,728
43 48,584
44 47,430
45 46,294
46 45,152
47 44,011
48 42,609
49 41,202
50 39,801
51 38,403
52 37,000
53 35,851
54 34,712
55 33,569
56 32,418
57 31,278
58 28,115
59 24,940
60 21,774
61 18,604
62 15,429
63 14,524
64 13,625
65 12,703
66 11,796
67 or over 9,222”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions

Tom Pursglove
Minister of State
27th March 2023 Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act
applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung
(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations™). The amendments made by regulation
2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 10.1 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after 1st April 2023.




A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no, or no significant, impact
on the private, voluntary or public sector is foreseen.

© Crown copyright 2023

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James,
Controller of His Majesty’s Stationery Office and King’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.






ISBN 978-0-34-824662-9

£6.90
http://www .legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2023/372

97780348"246629




