
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 377

The Medical Devices and Blood Safety and
Quality (Fees Amendment) Regulations 2023

Part 3
Amendment of the Blood Safety and Quality Regulations 2005

Amendment of the Blood Safety and Quality Regulations 2005

17.—(1)  Regulation 22 (fees) of the Blood Safety and Quality Regulations 2005(1) is amended
as follows.

(2)  In paragraph (2)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,074” substitute “£3,381”,
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£518” substitute “£570”, and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£463” substitute “£509”.

(3)  In paragraph (2A)(b), for “£492” substitute “£967”.
(4)  In paragraph (3)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,583” substitute “£3,552”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,292” substitute “£1,776”.

(5)  In paragraph (3A), for “£683” substitute “£751”.
(6)  In paragraph (3C)(c), for “£492” substitute “£967”.
(7)  In paragraph (5)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,583” substitute “£3,552”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,292” substitute “£1,776”.

(8)  In paragraph (5B)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,583” substitute “£3,552”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,292” substitute “£1,776”.

(9)  In paragraph (5C)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,583” substitute “£3,552”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,292” substitute “£1,776”.

(10)  In paragraph (5E), for “£10,000” substitute “£11,000”.

(1) S.I. 2005/50; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2005/2898, 2006/2013, 2008/525, and 2010/554.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/50
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/2898
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/2013
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/525
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/554

