
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Fees,
Awards and Support) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Cross Heading: SECTION 4. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 74

The Education (Student Fees, Awards and
Support) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

PART 3
Corresponding amendments to other subordinate legislation

CHAPTER 6

The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans and the Education
(Student Loans) (Repayment) (Amendment) (No. 2) etc.) Regulations 2018

SECTION 4

Payment rates

Amendments relating to payment rates

122. In regulation 12(1)(a), for “£27,892” substitute “£28,673”.

123. In regulation 13(4) for “£11,836” substitute “£12,167”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 122 in force at 16.2.2023, see reg. 1
I2 Reg. 123 in force at 16.2.2023, see reg. 1

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2023/74/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2023/74/regulation/1


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Fees, Awards
and Support) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Cross Heading: SECTION 4.


