Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 529

The Universal Credit (Administrative Earnings
Threshold) (Amendment) Regulations 2024

Amendment of the Universal Credit Regulations 2013

2. In paragraph (6) of regulation 99 of the Universal Credit Regulations 2013 (circumstances in
which requirements must not be imposed)(1)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “15 hours” substitute “18 hours”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “24 hours” substitute “29 hours”.

(1) S.1.2013/376 amended by S.I. 2015/89 and 1754, S.1. 2022/886 and S.I. 2023/7.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/376
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/89
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1754
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/886
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2023/7

