Document Generated: 2024-07-25
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULES

SCHEDULE 12

PROTECTIVE PROVISIONS

PART 14

FOR THE PROTECTION OF SUFFOLK COUNTY
COUNCIL AND CAMBRIDGESHIRE COUNTY COUNCIL
163. Where Suffolk County Council or Cambridgeshire County Council are the drainage
authority, Part 8 of this Schedule shall apply with the following amendments—
(a) In sub-paragraph 90(1), for “14 days” substitute “28 days”;
(b) In sub-paragraph 90(3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “2 months”;

(c) Inparagraph 94, for “make reasonable compensation for”, substitute “repay to the drainage
authority all reasonable”; and

(d) In paragraph 95, for “make reasonable compensation for” substitute “compensate the
drainage authority for all”.



