Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 85

The Education (Student Fees, Awards and
Support) (Amendment) Regulations 2024

PART 3

Corresponding amendments to other subordinate legislation
CHAPTER 6

The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans and the Education
(Student Loans) (Repayment) (Amendment) (No. 2) etc.) Regulations 2018

Substitution of amounts

52.—(1) Inregulation 12 (amount of the postgraduate doctoral degree loan), in paragraph (1)(a)
for “£28,673” substitute “£29,390”.

(2) In regulation 13 (payment of postgraduate doctoral degree loans), in paragraph (4), for
“£12,167” substitute “£12,471”.



